G:\M\INSELR\SELF_069. XML

AMENDMENT TO RULES CoOMM. PRINT 119-8

OFFERED BY MR. SELF OF TEXAS

At the end of subtitle A of title XVII, add the fol-

lowing:

1 SEC. 17 . MODIFICATION TO ARMS EXPORT CONTROL
2 ACT NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS.

3 Section 36 of the Arms Export Control Act (22
4 U.S.C. 2776) 1s amended—

5 (1) in subsection (a), by inserting “(or, in the
6 case of a defense article that is a firearm controlled
7 under category I of the United States Munitions
8 List, $4,000,000 or more)” after “$1,000,000 or
9 more’’ each place it appears; and
10 (2) in subsection (c¢), by striking “$1,000,000”
11 and inserting “$4,000,000".

g:\VHLD\082725\D082725.028.xml (101487611)

August 27, 2025 (11:49 a.m.)




Amendment to Rules Comm. Print 119–8


Offered by Mr. Self of Texas


At the end of subtitle A of title XVII, add the following:


SEC. 17__. Modification to Arms Export Control Act notification requirements.

Section 36 of the Arms Export Control Act (22 U.S.C. 2776) is amended—


(1) in subsection (a), by inserting “(or, in the case of a defense article that is a firearm controlled under category I of the United States Munitions List, $4,000,000 or more)” after “$1,000,000 or more” each place it appears; and


(2) in subsection (c), by striking “$1,000,000” and inserting “$4,000,000”.



  
   G:\M\19\SELF\SELF_069.XML XXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXX 8/27/2025 11:49 XXXXXXXXXXXXXX 08/27/2025 10:58 AM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXX   1014876|1  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 119th CONGRESS  1st Session 
 Amendment to Rules Comm. Print 119–8 
  
 Offered by  Mr. Self of Texas 
  
 
 
    
  At the end of subtitle A of title XVII, add the following:
 
  17__. Modification to Arms Export Control Act notification requirements Section 36 of the Arms Export Control Act (22 U.S.C. 2776) is amended—
  (1) in subsection (a), by inserting  (or, in the case of a defense article that is a firearm controlled under category I of the United States Munitions List, $4,000,000 or more) after  $1,000,000 or more each place it appears; and
  (2) in subsection (c), by striking  $1,000,000 and inserting  $4,000,000.
 

